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We use cookies and similar technologies like pixels (together referred to as “Cookies”) to provide you with the website
www.traderepublic.com (“Website”), analyze and improve the performance of our Website and for marketing purposes.
This document explains to you which Cookies we use on our Website, the purpose of the respective cookies and their
lifetime. It also classifies the Cookies into Necessary Cookies, Analytics and Testing Cookies and Marketing Cookies.

Not all of the Cookies mentioned in this document will be used by us when you visit our Website. Whether a Cookie will
be used depends on the choices you made regarding Cookies and on different factors such as how you use our
Website, on the current marketing campaigns we are running, whether you use a referral code, whether you login to
your account, whether you are being referred from the Trade Republic App to the Website, etc.

Analytics and Testing Cookies and Marketing Cookies are only dropped, if you have consented to them. You can
withdraw your consent any time at the bottom of the Website.

You can find more information on how we process your personal data in our Privacy Notice for the Trade Republic
Website.

Please note that when you reject Cookies, this does not have an effect on your Trade Republic customer profile or
in-App settings, since these systems are not connected to each other.

This Cookie Annex will be occasionally updated due to further development.

1. Necessary Cookies
“Necessary Cookies” are Cookies which are necessary to provide you with a secure and functioning Website. Without
these Cookies our Website would not function properly or our Website would be not secured sufficiently in line with the
legal obligations of a financial institution.

These Cookies will always be used by us, independent of whether you consented to the use of Cookies or not.

1.1 “i18n_redirected”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 year. It is only used for logged in customers. It ensures that the user’s preferred language
is used.

1.2 “analytics”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 year. It is dropped when you interact with the cookie banner on our Website. It indicates
whether you have accepted analytical cookies or not.

1.3 “marketing”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 year. It is dropped when you interact with the cookie banner on our Website. It indicates
whether you have accepted marketing cookies or not.

1.4 “tr_claims”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 year. The cookie is only set when you log into your account and is deleted once you log
out. This cookie is an authentication cookie and ensures the secure login into your customer account. Without this
cookie being present, you are immediately logged out of your customer account.

1.5 “tr_webview”

This cookie is a session cookie. In case customers navigate to our Website Helpcenter via their mobile app, this cookie is
used to provide relevant content and pre-fill forms.

1.6 “session_id”
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This cookie has a lifetime of 1 year. The cookie is only set when you log into your account and is deleted once you log
out. The cookie is also only set when you navigate to our Website Helpcenter via our Web Application. This cookie
indicates you login status for our Helpcenter.

1.7 “tr_appearance”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 year. Depending on this Cookie, we will display our Website in a light or dark pattern. This
cookie is based on your preferences. In case you have not made any choice, the default value of this cookie is a light
pattern.

1.8 “tr_external_id”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 year. This cookie is used for so-called ‘Feature Toggles’. This means that depending on
this cookie, you will have access to certain product features. For example, if you have a Trade Republic Card, this cookie
will ensure that you will have access to card features on our website.

1.9 “aws-waf-token”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 year. This cookie is used to ensure the security and integrity of your account. You can find
more information on this cookie here: https://docs.aws.amazon.com/waf/latest/developerguide/waf-tokens-details.html

2. Analytics Cookies and Testing Cookies
We use Cookies to improve our Website, analyze the use of our Website and to test new features and designs
(“Analytics and Testing Cookies and Marketing Cookies”).

Analytics and Testing Cookies and Marketing Cookies are only dropped, if you have consented to them. You can
withdraw your consent any time at the bottom of the Website.

2.1 “_ga +_ combination of letters and numbers”

We use Google Analytics to analyze and measure the performance of our website. Cookies dropped for this service are
usually named “_ga” together with a combination of further letters or numbers. All of these Cookies have the same
purpose (analytics) and same lifetime (13 months).

Google Analytics is a service offered by Google Ireland Limited, Gordon House, Barrow Street, Dublin 4, Ireland
(“Google”). More information regarding Google’s services, and especially Google Analytics, is available here:
https://policies.google.com/privacy?hl=en and here: https://safety.google/privacy/privacy-controls/

2.2 “_gid”

This cookie has a lifetime of 24 hours. The _gid-Cookie is another cookie used by Google Analytics. This cookie is used
to store and count website visits. It also assigns a unique user number to the user’s browser.

2.3 “dicbo_id”

This cookie is a session cookie with a short lifetime. Its purpose is to analyze traffic on our Website and create statistics
regarding the Website visitors and the Website overall functionality.

2.4 Testing Cookies

We use various cookies to run tests on our website to improve the stability and security of our website as well as your
experience (“Testing Cookies”). Below you will find an overview over the Testing Cookies we use. Testing Cookies may
also determine the content you see on our website and we will not use them in case you decline use of analytical
cookies.

2.4.1 “tr_user_exp_id”

This cookie has a lifetime of 90 days. This Testing Cookie stores a random user id value and is used for the experiment
assignment.
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2.4.2 “tr_features”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 hour. This Testing Cookies stores an encoded and encrypted feature list to enable or
disable some functionalities including managing A/B experiments.

2.4.3 “tr_exp_variant (or tr_exp_variant + Number)”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 hour. This Testing Cookie allows us to show different content to different users. The name
of this Testing Cookie can include numbers and depending on these numbers, a different content might be shown to
users.

2.4.4 “tr_exp_impression”

This cookie has a lifetime of 1 hour. This Testing Cookie is only dropped if an experiment is running. It stores information
regarding the experiment such as the experiment ID and enables tracking of the experiment via Google Analytics.

3. Marketing Cookies
We use Cookies to promote our services to website users and the general public; this includes personalizing
advertisements on other websites and services (“Marketing Cookies”). Marketing Cookies are also used to analyze the
performance of our campaigns and to improve them. While you can see our advertisements on various websites, we
mainly work with Google’s Marketing products.

We only use Marketing Cookies based on your consent which you can withdraw anytime.

3.1 “_gcl_au”

This cookie has a lifetime of 90 days. The _gcl_au-Cookie tracks the performance of campaigns run by us. This cookie is
set in a user’s browser when they click on an ad shown via Google Display Network. This cookie allows us to understand
which users have interacted with our advertisements and have later taken an action on our website (including signing up
for a customer account).

3.2 “_fbp”

This cookie has a lifetime of 90 days. The _fbp-Cookie is operated by Meta Platforms Ireland Limited, 4 Grand Canal
Square, Dublin 2, Ireland (“Meta”). This cookie tracks website visitors across different websites and allows us to
understand the performance of our marketing campaigns and to show our ads to our website visitors on Meta’s service
like Facebook.
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